
Wednesday, May 23, 2018 - Accusing God of Sin 
 
Throughout the centuries of Rome's existence, the popes have regularly claimed 
to be divine. As the supposed successor of Peter, the Pope claims infallibility, the 
position of God on Earth, and ability to judge and excommunicate angels. 
 
A letter from Cardinal Giuseppe Sarto (who became Pope Pius X in 1903) as 
quoted in Publications of the Catholic Truth Society Volume 29 (Catholic Truth 
Society: 1896): 
 
"The Pope represents Jesus Christ Himself..." 
 
This belief has so assimilated into society's thinking that it is believed by many 
beyond Catholic circles. 
 
The continuing arrogance of the catholic church is on display again this week as 
the self proclaimed "God on Earth" declared to a homosexual man, Juan Carlos 
Cruz, a Chilean victim who suffered sexual abuse at the hands of catholic priests, 
""God made you that way and loves you as you are..." 
 
Let me state this as calmly as I can put it. What a blasphemous statement and 
utter nonsense. This statement BLATANTLY accuses God of predetermining 
someone to sin as opposed to what the totality of scripture teaches which is sin is 
a CHOICE and He provides us a way of escape if we desire (1 Cor. 10:13). 
 
For those who accept the Bible as the authoritative, inspired Word of God, the 
controversy over the morality of homosexuality is easily settled. The Scriptures 
unequivocally condemn homosexual behavior and call it SIN! From the creation 
account we learn that God’s plan for sexual fulfillment is for one man and one 
woman to be joined together as one flesh in marriage; ANY other sexual activity 
is fornication, a sin which brings the judgment of God. 
 
· Genesis 2:18-25 - And Jehovah God said, It is not good that the man should be 
alone; I will make him a help meet for him. And out of the ground Jehovah God 
formed every beast of the field, and every bird of the heavens; and brought them 
unto the man to see what he would call them: and whatsoever the man called 
every living creature, that was the name thereof. And the man gave names to all 
cattle, and to the birds of the heavens, and to every beast of the field; but for man 
there was not found a help meet for him. And Jehovah God caused a deep sleep 
to fall upon the man, and he slept; and he took one of his ribs, and closed up the 
flesh instead thereof: and the rib, which Jehovah God had taken from the man, 
made he a woman, and brought her unto the man. And the man said, This is now 
bone of my bones, and flesh of my flesh: she shall be called Woman, because 
she was taken out of Man. Therefore shall a man leave his father and his mother, 
and shall cleave unto his wife: and they shall be one flesh. 
 



The destruction of Sodom and Gomorrah serves as a frightening warning to any 
people who would become so permissive with regard to sexual immorality that it 
would sanction the depravity of homosexuality. 
 
· Genesis 19:1-28 shares with us that two angels come to Sodom and stay at 
Lot’s house. Picking up in Verse 4: Now before they lay down, the men of the 
city, the men of Sodom, both old and young, all the people from every quarter, 
surrounded the house. And they called to Lot and said to him, "Where are the 
men who came to you tonight? Bring them out to us that we may know them 
carnally." So Lot went out to them through the doorway, shut the door behind 
him, and said, "Please, my brethren, do not do so wickedly! "See now, I have two 
daughters who have not known a man; please, let me bring them out to you, and 
you may do to them as you wish; only do nothing to these men, since this is the 
reason they have come under the shadow of my roof." And they said, "Stand 
back!" Then they said, "This one came in to stay here, and he keeps acting as a 
judge; now we will deal worse with you than with them." So they pressed hard 
against the man Lot, and came near to break down the door. But the men 
reached out their hands and pulled Lot into the house with them, and shut the 
door. And they struck the men who were at the doorway of the house with 
blindness, both small and great, so that they became weary trying to find the 
door. Then the men said to Lot, "Have you anyone else here? Son-in-law, your 
sons, your daughters, and whomever you have in the city-take them out of this 
place! "For we will destroy this place, because the outcry against them has grown 
great before the face of the LORD, and the LORD has sent us to destroy it." 
 
Later, the Mosaic law would describe homosexuality as an abomination which 
was like other forms of sexual immorality, punishable by death 
 
· Lev. 18:22 - Thou shalt not lie with mankind, as with womankind: it is 
abomination. 
 
· Lev. 20:13 - And if a man lie with mankind, as with womankind, both of them 
have committed abomination: they shall surely be put to death; their blood shall 
be upon them. 
 
Some dismiss the Old Testament texts as irrelevant to our time, but the New 
Testament is equally unambiguous. Paul, in Romans 1 beginning in verse 24 
talks specifically about this perversity Wherefore God also gave them up to 
uncleanness through the lusts of their own hearts, to dishonor their own bodies 
between themselves: 
 
· Who changed the truth of God into a lie, and worshipped and served the 
creature more than the Creator, who is blessed forever. Amen. For this cause 
God gave them up unto vile affections: for even their women did change the 
natural use into that which is against nature: And likewise also the men, leaving 
the natural use of the woman, burned in their lust one toward another; men with 



men working that which is unseemly, and receiving in themselves that 
recompense of their error which was due. And even as they did not like to retain 
God in their knowledge, God gave them over to a reprobate mind, to do those 
things which are not convenient; Being filled with all unrighteousness, fornication, 
wickedness, covetousness, maliciousness; full of envy, murder, strife, deceit, 
malignity; whisperers, Backbiters, haters of God, despiteful, proud, boasters, 
inventors of evil things, disobedient to parents, Without understanding, covenant 
breakers, without natural affection, implacable, unmerciful: Who knowing the 
judgment of God, that they which commit such things are worthy of death, not 
only do the same, but have pleasure in them that do them. 
 
Paul portrays the depravity of the Gentiles to be result of their abandonment of 
the knowledge of God they “exchanged the truth of God for a lie” (V 25) and 
refused to have God in their knowledge (v 28). The increasing acceptance of 
homosexuality in our own culture is a symptom of the deeper problem of the 
movement away from a theistic to a secular worldview. It is an alarming 
indication of the degree to which Americans have forsaken the objective standard 
of morality – grounded in the nature of God and revealed in his Word. 
 
· 1 Cor. 6:9-10 - Or know ye not that the unrighteous shall not inherit the kingdom 
of God? Be not deceived: neither fornicators, nor idolaters, nor adulterers, nor 
effeminate, nor abusers of themselves with men, nor thieves, nor covetous, nor 
drunkards, nor revilers, nor extortioners, shall inherit the kingdom of God. 
 
Paul stated that there would be times when, “...the time will come when they will 
not endure the sound doctrine; but, having itching ears, will heap to themselves 
teachers after their own lusts; and will turn away their ears from the truth, and 
turn aside unto fables.” What are we to do? “Preach the word; be urgent in 
season, out of season; reprove, rebuke, exhort, with all longsuffering and 
teaching.” 
 
No fable told will ever make sin acceptable to God. If it looks like sin and the 
bible calls it sin, it’s sin. 


